
1. Accept bids for electric transformers. (Rob Neely) 

On October 1, 2013, OED received permission to advertise and bid for electric 
transformers. OED received sealed bids for electric transformers on Thursday, November 
7th. Enclosed in your packet is a bid tabulation of the bids received. OED would like 
permission to accept the bids and proceed with ordering the necessary transformers. 
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UNDERGROUNDPADMOUNTTRANSFORMERS 

SINGLE PHASE 

Item OED Item Description Proposed Item Howard Irby Utility Utilicor 
No. Stock# Quantity Unit Indus. GEMANUF GEMANUF 

1. 842 50 KVA UG 12470/7200 20 Ea. $1653.00 $1630.00 $1579.00 
Grounded Wye 240/1 20 8-10 WKS 7WKS 8-10 WKS 
FR3 Coolant Filled 

2. 843 25 KVA UG 12470/7200 20 Ea. $1300.00 $1288.00 $1248.00 
Grounded Wye 240/120 8-10 WKS 7WKS 8-10 WKS 
FR3 Coolant Filled 

3. 844 75 KVA UG 12470/7200 15 Ea. $2005.00 $2086.00 $2020.00 
Grounded Wye 240/120 8-10 WKS 7WKS 8-10 WKS 
FR3 Coolant Filled 

4. 846 100 KVA UG 12470/7200 2 Ea. $3046.00 $2611.00 $2529.00 
Grounded Wye 240/120 8-10 WKS 6-8 WKS 8-10 WKS 
FR3 Coolant Filled 

5. 848 167 KVA UG 12470/7200 1 Ea. $3802.00 $3986.00 $3860.00 
Grounded Wye 240/120 8-10 WKS 7WKS 8-10 WKS 
FR3 Coolant Filled 



THREE PHASE 

Item OED Item Description Proposed Item Howard Irby Utility Utilicor 
No. Stock# Quantity Unit Indus. GEMANUF GEMANUF 

1. 845 75 KVA UG 13200 208/120 2 Ea. $6353.00 $6336.00 $6135.00 
FR3 Coolant Filled 10-12 WKS 9WKS 9-11 WKS 

a. 75 KVA UG 13200 480/277 1 Ea. $6810.00 $6228.00 $6030.00 
FR3 Coolant Filled 10-12 WKS 9WKS 9-11 WKS 

b. 75 KVA UG 13200 240/120 1 Ea. $6204.00 $6404.00 $6201.00 
FR3 Coolant Filled 10-12 WKS 9WKS 9-11 WKS 

2. 847 150 KVA UG 13200 208/120 5 Ea. $7157.00 $7137.00 $6911.00 
FR3 Coolant Filled 10-12 WKS 9WKS 9-11 WKS 

a. 150 KVA UG 13200 480/277 1 Ea. $7092.00 $7093.00 $6868.00 
FR3 Coolant Filled 10-12 WKS 9WKS 9-11 WKS 

b. 150 KVA UG 13200 240/120 1 Ea. $7255.00 $7147.00 $6921.00 
FR3 Coolant Filled 10-12 WKS 9WKS 9-11 WKS 

3. 852 250 KVA UG 13200 208/120 1 Ea. $9873.00 $9404.00 $9106.00 
FR3 Coolant Filled 10-12 WKS 9WKS 9-11 WKS 

a. 250 KV AUG 13200 480/277 1 Ea. $9875.00 $8743.00 $8466.00 
FR3 Coolant Filled 10-12 WKS 9WKS 9-11 WKS 

b. 250 KVA UG 13200 240/120 l Ea. $9950.00 $9451.00 $9152.00 
FR3 Coolant Filled 10-12 WKS 9WKS 9-11 WKS 

4. 853 300 KVA UG 13200 208/120 2 Ea. $10,144.00 $10,547.00 $10,213.00 
FR3 Coolant Filled 10-12 WKS 9WKS 9-11 WKS 

a. 300 KVA UG 13200 480/277 1 Ea. $9911.00 $8744.00 $8467.00 
FR3 Coolant Filled 10-12 WKS 9WKS 9-11 WKS 

b. 300 KVA UG 13200 240/120 1 Ea. $10,090.00 $9464.00 $9164.00 
FR3 Coolant Filled 10-12 WKS 9WKS 9-11 WKS 

5. 856 500 KVA UG 13200 480/277 1 Ea. $11 ,691.00 $10,100.00 $9781.00 
FR3 Coolant Filled 10-12 WKS 9WKS 9-11 WKS 

a. 500 KV A UG 13200 2401120 1 Ea. $12,211.00 $11,224.00 $10,869.00 
FR3 Coolant Filled 10-12 WKS 9WKS 9-11 WKS 

6. 900 750 KVA UG 13200 208/120 1 Ea. $17,710.00 $14,214.00 $13,765.00 
FR3 Coolant Filled 10-12 WKS 9WKS 9-11 WKS 

a. 750 KVA UG 13200 480/277 1 Ea. $17,417.00 $13,508.00 $13,081.00 
FR3 Coolant Filled 10-12 WKS 9WKS 9-1 1 WKS 

b. 750 KVA UG 13200 240/120 1 Ea. $17,607.00 $14,544.00 $14,084.00 
FR3 Coolant Filled 10-12 WKS 9WKS 9- 11 WKS 



Item OED Item Description Proposed Item Howard Irby Utility Utilicor 
No. Stock# Quantity Unit Indus. GEMANUF GEMANUF 

7. 1000 KVA UG 13200 1 Ea. $21,822.00 $19,804.00 $19,177.00 
208/120 10-12 WKS 9WKS 9-11 WKS 
FR3 Coolant Filled 

a. 1000 KVA UG 13200 1 Ea. $19,628.00 $14,769.00 $14,302.00 
480/277 10-12 WKS 9WKS 9-11 WKS 
FR3 Coolant Filled 

b. 1000 KVA UG 13200 1 Ea. $21,583.00 $17,662.00 $17,104.00 
2401120 10-12 WKS 9WKS 9-11 WKS 
FR3 Coolant Filled 

8. 1500KVA UG 13200 1 Ea. $37,000.00 $37,188.00 $36,013.00 
208/120 10-12 WKS 9WKS 9-11 WKS 
FR3 Coolant Filled 

a. 1500 KV AUG 13200 1 Ea. $26,040.00 $20,25 1.00 $19,611.00 
480/277 10-12 WKS 9WKS 9-11 WKS 
FR3 Coolant Filled 

b. 1500 KVA UG 13200 1 Ea. $31 ,412.00 $31,587.00 $30,589.00 
240/120 10-12 WKS 9WKS 9-11 WKS 
FR3 Coolant Filled 

9. 2000 KV A UG 13200 1 Ea. NO BID NO BID NO BID 
208/1 20 
FR3 Coolant Filled 

a. 2000 KV AUG 13200 1 Ea. $30,413 .00 $27,948.00 $27,065.00 
480/277 10-12 WKS 9WKS 9-11 WKS 
FR3 Coolant Filled 

b. 2000 KV A UG 13200 1 Ea. NO BID $42,858.00 $41,504.00 
240/120 9WKS 9-11 WKS 
FR3 Coolant Filled 

10. 2500 KVA UG 13200 1 Ea. NO BID NO BID NO BID 
208/120 
FR3 Coolant Filled 

a. 2500 KV AUG 13200 1 Ea. $37,339.00 $37,408.00 $36,226.00 
480/277 10-12 WKS 9WKS 9-11 WKS 
FR3 Coolant Filled 

b. 2500 KV AUG 13200 1 Ea. NO BID NO BID NO BID 
240/120 
FR3 Coolant Filled 

GRESCO ALSO QUOTED ON SEALED BID .. .WE DO NOT PURCHASE ERMCO BRAND THAT WAS QUOTED ... 


